
Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1084587
Vendor Name: Follett Higher Education, LLC

Check Details:
Check Number: E0106373
Check Amount: $ 4,167.10
Check Date: 3/18/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: P0016200
Invoice Date: 3/5/2025
PO Number: P0016200
Voucher Number: V0878420

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below
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Wed, Mar 5, 2025 at 09:30 PM UTC

"Shaba Patel (0784)" <s.patel@follett.com>

[External] PO# P0016200

 <s.patel@follett.com>"Shaba Patel (0784)"

CC:

BCC:

 This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive CAUTION:
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Shaba Patel
Store Manager
College of DuPage bookstore

   

  Phone   630.942.4347
  Address   425 Fawell Blvd, Glen Ellyn IL 60137
  Website   follett.com | cod.bkstr.com

   Email   s.patel@follett.com

3 attachments
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Dep purchase_03052025150929.PDF



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1084587
Vendor Name: Follett Higher Education, LLC

Check Details:
Check Number: E0106373
Check Amount: $ 4,167.10
Check Date: 3/18/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 030625
Invoice Date: 3/6/2025
PO Number: NULL
Voucher Number: V0878388

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1







Mon, Mar 10, 2025 at 04:04 PM UTC

"Shaba Patel (0784)" <s.patel@follett.com>

[External] Dpt purchase- 030625

 <s.patel@follett.com>"Shaba Patel (0784)"

CC:

BCC:

 This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive CAUTION:
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Shaba Patel
Store Manager
College of DuPage bookstore

   

  Phone   630.942.4347
  Address   425 Fawell Blvd, Glen Ellyn IL 60137
  Website   follett.com | cod.bkstr.com

   Email   s.patel@follett.com

3 attachments
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Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1084587
Vendor Name: Follett Higher Education, LLC

Check Details:
Check Number: E0106373
Check Amount: $ 4,167.10
Check Date: 3/18/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: 02052025
Invoice Date: 2/5/2025
PO Number: NULL
Voucher Number: V0877666

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1







Mon, Mar 10, 2025 at 04:05 PM UTC

"Shaba Patel (0784)" <s.patel@follett.com>

[External] Dpt purchase- 02052025

 <s.patel@follett.com>"Shaba Patel (0784)"

CC:

BCC:

 This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive CAUTION:
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Shaba Patel
Store Manager
College of DuPage bookstore

   

  Phone   630.942.4347
  Address   425 Fawell Blvd, Glen Ellyn IL 60137
  Website   follett.com | cod.bkstr.com

   Email   s.patel@follett.com

3 attachments

Outlook-1fjcfftb.png

02052025_03102025103329.PDF

Outlook-ccxleojg.png



Information:
Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1084587
Vendor Name: Follett Higher Education, LLC

Check Details:
Check Number: E0106373
Check Amount: $ 4,167.10
Check Date: 3/18/2025

Invoice Details:
Invoice Number: DRS310251726776
Invoice Date: 3/12/2025
PO Number: NULL
Voucher Number: V0876113

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below

1
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Hickey, Kevin

From: Annarella, Paul
Sent: Tuesday, March 11, 2025 3:53 PM
To: Hickey, Kevin
Subject: FW: [External] RE: 3-10-25 State of IL Payments - Sherlyn Argueta 1726776

 
 
Paul Annarella 
Accounts Receivable Coordinator 
College of DuPage 
 
425 Fawell Blvd. | SRC 2130 | Glen Ellyn, IL  60137-6599 
Phone 630.942.4472 | Fax 630.942.2297 
 
 
From: George, Mark <georgem580@cod.edu>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 11, 2025 2:32 PM 
To: Annarella, Paul <annarellap@cod.edu> 
Subject: FW: [External] RE: 3-10-25 State of IL Payments - Sherlyn Argueta 1726776 
 
Paul, 
 
Take a look at this below. I can respond to him afterwards. 
 
Regards, 
 
Mark George 
Financial Aid Representative 
O ice of Student Financial Assistance 
630.942.2829 
College of DuPage  
425 Fawell Blvd | Glen Ellyn, IL 60137 
 
From: Cabeza, Ramon <Ramon.Cabeza@illinois.gov>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 11, 2025 1:37 PM 
To: George, Mark <georgem580@cod.edu> 
Cc: Hyland, Cassandra <Cassandra.Hyland@Illinois.gov> 
Subject: [External] RE: 3-10-25 State of IL Payments - Sherlyn Argueta 1726776 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond with sensitive 
information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Hello Mark, 
 
You should have received one check for $848.99 for an Ipad purchase and the other one for books and supplies for 
$205.19 to the bookstore.  Can those funds be sent to the bookstore on behalf of DRS for the student? 
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Thanks 
 
Ramon. 
 
From: George, Mark <georgem580@cod.edu>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 11, 2025 12:42 PM 
To: Cabeza, Ramon <Ramon.Cabeza@illinois.gov> 
Subject: [External] FW: 3-10-25 State of IL Payments - Sherlyn Argueta 1726776 
Importance: High 
 
Good Afternoon, Ramon, 
 
Our Accounts Receivable office has a question about payments received on behalf of Sherlyn Argueta 
1726776. Can you look into that and let me know what you find out? See emails below. 
 
Regards, 
 
Mark George 
Financial Aid Representative 
O ice of Student Financial Assistance 
630.942.2829 
College of DuPage  
425 Fawell Blvd | Glen Ellyn, IL 60137 
 
From: Annarella, Paul <annarellap@cod.edu>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 11, 2025 12:37 PM 
To: George, Mark <georgem580@cod.edu>; Ortiz, Ivette <ortizi520@cod.edu> 
Cc: Hamler, David <hamlerd@cod.edu> 
Subject: RE: 3-10-25 State of IL Payments - Sherlyn Argueta 1726776 
 
Just ask the counselor about the payment received 3/10/2025 for $1054.18.  Ask if this was issued by DRS and if so 
why? 
 
Thanks! 
 
Paul Annarella 
Accounts Receivable Coordinator 
College of DuPage 
 
425 Fawell Blvd. | SRC 2130 | Glen Ellyn, IL  60137-6599 
Phone 630.942.4472 | Fax 630.942.2297 
 
From: Annarella, Paul <annarellap@cod.edu>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 11, 2025 11:49 AM 
To: Ortiz, Ivette <ortizi520@cod.edu>; George, Mark <georgem580@cod.edu> 
Cc: Hamler, David <hamlerd@cod.edu> 
Subject: FW: 3-10-25 State of IL Payments - Sherlyn Argueta 1726776 
Importance: High 
 
Good morning, 
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Today we received two payments for student Sherlyn Argueta 1726776 for a total of $1054.18.  Is this student 
expecting any payment from IL?  Is this student using the DRS benefit?  I ran a TFAR and do not see this student 
listed.  Any help would be appreciated. 
 
Thanks! 
 
Paul Annarella 
Accounts Receivable Coordinator 
College of DuPage 
 
425 Fawell Blvd. | SRC 2130 | Glen Ellyn, IL  60137-6599 
Phone 630.942.4472 | Fax 630.942.2297 
 
 
State of Illinois - CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be 
attorney-client privileged or attorney work product, may constitute inside information or internal deliberative staff 
communication, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this communication in 
error, please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. Receipt by an unintended recipient does not waive attorney-client privilege, attorney work 
product privilege, or any other exemption from disclosure.  



Thu, Mar 13, 2025 at 07:20 PM UTC

Accounts Payable <acctpay@cod.edu>

FW: Follett Check Request DRS 31025 1726776

Accounts Payable <acctpay@cod.edu>

CC:

BCC:

 

 

Marivic Zerrudo

Accounts Payable Specialist

College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd l SRC 2132 l Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

phone 630-942-2601 l zerrudom@cod.edu

 

From: Hickey, Kevin <hickeyk158@cod.edu> 
 Thursday, March 13, 2025 10:01 AMSent:

 Accounts Payable <acctpay@cod.edu>To:
 Follett Check Request DRS 31025 1726776Subject:

 

Good Morning,

 

Please see the attached for a check request to forward funds received from the state to Follett. Please let 
me know if you need any additional information.

 

Thanks,



Kevin

 

Kevin Hickey

Senior Accountant l Financial Affairs

College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd l SRC 2130 l Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599 l USA

phone 630.942.2239 l fax 630.942.2297 l hickeyk158@cod.edu

 

1 attachment

KH 3-10 State of IL Follett Check Request.pdf
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